

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Quick Set Flowable Fill and Concrete Delivery
 FOR:
 TIME & (October 1, 2018 through September 30, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 14, 2018

Custom-Crete, LLC
 331 N Main St.
 Enless, TX 76039

MKI Construction Services,
 LLC
 4111 Factory Hill
 San Antonio, TX 78219

KLP Commercial

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY				
GROUP 1	FLOWABLE FILL				
Item 1	Flowable Fill during Normal Hours	Price/ Cu.Yds.			
1.	200 cy Quick Set Flowable Fill	TOTAL	99.90 19,980.00	105.00 21,000.00	NO BID
Item 2	Flowable Fill during After Hours/Emergency	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.			
2.	20 cy Quick Set Flowable Fill	TOTAL	99.90 1,998.00	125.00 2,500.00	NO BID
Item 3	Flowable Fill Full/Half Day "Rentals"	PRICE			
3.	2 ea. Full Day (including vehicle and driver)	EACH TOTAL	3,000.00 6,000.00	2,100.00 4,200.00	NO BID
4.	2 ea. Half Day (including vehicle and driver)	PRICE EACH TOTAL	2,000.00 4,000.00	1,050.00 2,100.00	NO BID
5.	20 cy Quick Set Flowable Fill	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	99.90 1,998.00	85.00 1,700.00	NO BID
Item 4	Delivery Charges	PRICE			
6.	20 ea. Flowable Fill Standard Delivery Charge (per order)	EACH TOTAL	55.00 1,100.00	0.00 0.00	NO BID
7.	2 ea. Flowable Fill Emergency Order Delivery Charge (may apply to orders requiring delivery within 2 hours of notification)	PRICE EACH TOTAL	500.00 1,000.00	125.00 250.00	NO BID
Item 5	Penalty Costs				
8.	5 hrs. Stand-by charge (may apply when Contractor has to wait at site over 1 hour to start pouring)	PRICE/ HOUR TOTAL	240.00 1,200.00	120.00 600.00	NO BID
9.	5 ea. Cancellation Charge (may apply to orders not cancelled within 3 hours of scheduled pour)	PRICE EACH TOTAL	250.00 1,250.00	0.00 0.00	NO BID
				*	
	TOTAL ALL ITEMS GROUP 1	TOTAL	38,526.00	32,350.00	NO BID
GROUP 2	CONCRETE				
Item 1	Concrete Orders Less of 3 1/2 CY or More during Normal Hours	Price/ Cu.Yds.			
1.	60 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A)	TOTAL	122.90 7,374.00	NO BID	NO BID
2.	10 cy Concrete (4,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	127.90 1,279.00	NO BID	NO BID
3.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 3/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	155.90 1,559.00	NO BID	NO BID
4.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 5/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 1/4" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item 2	Concrete Orders of 3 1/2 CY or More during Normal Hours	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.			
6.	100 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A)	TOTAL	122.90 12,290.00	NO BID	NO BID
7.	20 cy Concrete (4,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	127.90 2,558.00	NO BID	NO BID
8.	20 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 3/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	155.90 3,118.00	NO BID	NO BID
9.	20 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 5/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds. TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Quick Set Flowable Fill and Concrete Delivery

FOR: (October 1, 2018 through September 30, 2019)

TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 14, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Custom-Crete, LLC
 331 N Main St.
 Enless, TX 76039

MKI Construction Services,
 LLC
 4111 Factory Hill
 San Antonio, TX 78219

KLP Commercial

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	TOTAL			
10.	20 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 1/4" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item 3	Concrete Orders Less of 3 1/2 CY during After Hours/Emergency	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.				
11.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	122.90	1,229.00	NO BID	NO BID
12.	5 cy Concrete (4,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	127.90	639.50	NO BID	NO BID
13.	5 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 3/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	155.90	779.50	NO BID	NO BID
14.	5 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 5/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15.	5 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 1/4" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item 4	Concrete Orders of 3 1/2 CY or More during After Hours/Emergency	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.				
16.	20 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	122.90	2,458.00	NO BID	NO BID
17.	10 cy Concrete (4,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	127.90	1,279.00	NO BID	NO BID
18.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 3/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	155.90	1,559.00	NO BID	NO BID
19.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 5/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
20.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 1/4" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item 5	Concrete Full/Half Day "Rentals"	PRICE				
21.	2 ea. Full Day (including vehicle and driver)	EACH	3,000.00	6,000.00	NO BID	NO BID
22.	2 ea. Half Day (including vehicle and driver)	EACH	2,000.00	4,000.00	NO BID	NO BID
23.	20 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	122.90	2,458.00	NO BID	NO BID
24.	10 cy Concrete (4,000 PSI Class A)	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	127.90	1,279.00	NO BID	NO BID
25.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 3/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.	155.90	1,559.00	NO BID	NO BID
26.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 5/8" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27.	10 cy Concrete (3,000 PSI Class A) with 1/4" Wash Rock Finish	PRICE/ Cu.Yds.		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item 6	Delivery Charges	PRICE				
28.	30 ea. Full Day (including vehicle and driver)	EACH	55.00	1,650.00	NO BID	NO BID
29.	3 ea. Concrete Emergency Order Delivery Charge (may apply to orders requiring delivery within 6 hours of notification)	EACH	500.00	1,500.00	NO BID	NO BID
Item 7	Delivery Charges	PRICE/ HOUR				
30.	5 hrs Stand-by Charge (may when Contractor has to wait at site over 1 hour to start pouring)	HOUR	240.00	1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Quick Set Flowable Fill and Concrete Delivery

FOR: (October 1, 2018 through September 30, 2019)

TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 14, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

31. 5 ea. Cancellation Charge (may apply to orders not cancelled within 3 hours of scheduled pour)

PRICE EACH TOTAL

Custom-Crete, LLC
331 N Main St.
Enless, TX 76039

MKI Construction Services,
LLC
4111 Factory Hill
San Antonio, TX 78219

KLP Commercial

250.00
1,250.00

NO BID

NO BID

*

TOTAL ALL ITEMS GROUP 2

TOTAL

57,018.00

NO BID

NO BID

EXTENSION 1

57,018.00

32,350.00

EXTENSION 2

57,018.00

32,350.00

EXTENSION 3

57,018.00

32,350.00

EXTENSION 4

57,018.00

32,350.00

Terms

Net
30 days

2%
10 days

Delivery Days

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

- Alamo Concrete
- Custom Crete, LLC
- Kelly Murphy
- KLP Commercial
- MK1 Construction Services
- Mobile Crete
- Old Castle Cusom Crete
- OP Concrete
- Scofield Construction Services dba Mobile Crete
- Tex Star Enterprise

- Demandstar
- SAWS Website